
Worship Overview and Prayer Plan SUMMER 2025 

Week WB Bible Content 

Theme: To boldly go!.... 
• Worldwide Journeys 
• Spiritual Journeys 
• Our Journeys 

Sing & 
Praise 

Prayer 
by……. 

1 

28 Apr 
Reflective 
Worship 
 01 04 25 

Joshua 1:9 

Passport: We’re going on a 
journey.. 

Have you got your passport? 
A reflective story 

introducing the wider themes 
of the term 

KS1 Year 1 

2 

05 05 25 
Family 

Worship 
06 04 25 

Luke 24: 13-35 

The walk,,, 
Resurrection Day and 
Emmaus Road journey 

VE Day 80th Anniversary 

KS2  
BH Year 2 

3 12 May 
 

Hebrews 12: 1 
1 Thessalonians 

5:11 
 

Waterproof: Pedalling a 
penny farthing! 

Thomas Stevens: the story 
of the Victorian cyclist who 

cycled across the world 
between 1884 & 1887, 

despite many challenges (and 
lots of weather!) 

Compass: Adventure for the 
fun of it!  

Amelia Earhart: Blazing a 
trail for women in a man’s 

world 

KS1 Year 4 

4 

19 May 
Pupil Led 
worship 

22 05 25 

Matthew 7: 24-
27 

 

Rope: Everest Edmund 
Hillary & Tenzing Norgay: 

trust on the journey  
 

KS2 Year R 

 HALF TERM – (Ascension Day Thursday 29th May) 

5 

02 June 
Family 

Worship  
02 06 25 
Pentecost 

Sunday 8th June 

Acts 2: 1-42 

A gift for the journey: a 
present of the presence 

Pentecost, the birth of the 
Church and a gift for 

Christians from God, for the 
journey of life 

KS1 Year 3 

6 09 June Acts 9: 1-18 

Sunglasses: Paul’s journey 
The start of Paul’s journey 

begins with a challenge 
Father’s Day – A celebration 

KS2 Year 6 

7 

16 June 
Reflective 
Worship 
19 06 25 

Selection Acts 
14-28 

Map: Through many 
dangers….  

Paul travels the ‘world’ with 
his message 

KS1 Year 5 
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8 

23 June  
Pupil Led 
worship 

26 06 25 

Genesis 21: 14-
21 
 

Water: the well of Zamzam 
The story of Hagar’s journey 

– a journey that pilgrims 
remember on Hajj  

KS2 Year 2 

9 30 Jun 
 

• Matthew 6:20 
• Daniel 12:3   

 

Mini toiletries: Travel light 
Guru Nanak and the needle: 
Story of Guru Nanak and 

Duni Chand  
Torch: Buddha’s journey to 
Enlightenment Dharma Day 

(10th July) King of the 
Quails, a story from the 

Jataka Tales: wise teaching 
as a light for the journey  

KS1 Year 4 

10 

07 Jul 
Family 

Worship 
07 07 25 

 

Psalm: 133:1 

School badge/logo: One 
small step… The moon 

landing: a team effort, ‘to 
infinity and beyond’, which 

includes the women 
mathematicians who made it 

happen 

KS2 Year 5 

11 

14 Jul 
Pupil Led 
worship 
17 07 25 

Yr 6 Leavers 
Worship 
18 07 25 

 

Matthew 28:20 

Your journey 
 Words from the Bible as we 
‘move on’. We end this term 
with a chance to create our 

own reflection 
journeys….without leaving 

school! 

KS1 
 Year 6 

12 21 Jul  INSET   

 


